BID TABULATION

KITCHEN COMMERCIAL SANITIZERS
ITB: 94-22

JOY MCDOWELL

mcdowelli@jccal.org

1. Central Paper Company

2. 3G Chemical Solutions

*3. Grainger Inc.

Item |Description Qty |UOM Unit Price Ext. Total Unit Price Ext. Total Unit Price | Ext. Total

Food Processing Surface Sanitizers

Kills human Coronavirus and Hepatitis A in 60 seconds; kills

99% of germs on surfaces; eliminates Listeria, Salmonella,

E. coli and Norovirus in 30 seconds; NSF D2 registered;
1 requires no rinse; sanitizes gloves and footwear in 10 35 |CASE $37.10 $1,298.50 $79.00 $2,765.00 $941.78 $18,835.60

seconds; helps remove food allergens on hard, non-porous

surfaces; formulated with approved EPA ingredients for

Food Contact Sanitizing Solutions, recognized as GRAS

Direct Food Substances by the FDA.
Number and size per case 4/1 gallon 4/1 gallons 50 gallon
Manufacturer GOJO/PURELL ATHEA PURELL
Product Number 4341-04 #175 5047-01
Item [Description Qty (UOM Unit Price Ext. Total Unit Price Ext. Total Unit Price | Ext. Total

Food Processing Surface Sanitizers

Kills human Coronavirus and Hepatitis A in 60 seconds; kills

99% of germs on surfaces; eliminates Listeria, Salmonella,

E. coli and Norovirus in 30 seconds; NSF D2 registered;
2 requires no rinse; sanitizes gloves and footwear in 10 20 |DRUM $576.60 $11,532.00 $885.76 $17,715.20 $40.00 $1,400.00
= seconds; helps remove food allergens on hard, non-porous (=

surfaces; formulated with approved EPA ingredients for

Food Contact Sanitizing Solutions, recognized as GRAS

Direct Food Substances by the FDA. (50 GALLON

DRUM)
Number of gallons per drum 1/50 gallon 55 gallons 32 0z/6 pack
Manufacturer GOJO/PURELL ATHEA PURELL
Product Number 5047-01 #175 3341-06

1. Central Paper Company | 2. 3G Chemical Solutions 3. Grainger Inc.

Item |Description |Qty |UOM Unit Price Ext. Total Unit Price Ext. Total Unit Price | Ext. Total
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Foodservice Surface Sanitizer
Kills human Coronavirus and Hepatitis A in 60 seconds;
3 eliminated Norovirus, Salmonella, E. coli and Listeriain30 |40 [CASE $22.60 $904.00 $62.00 $2,480.00 NO BID NO BID
seconds; no handwashing required after use; kosher pareve;
proven effective across most hard and soft surfaces.
Number and size per case 6 x 320z 6/32 oz N/A
Manufacturer GOJO/PURELL PURELL N/A
Product Number 3341-06 3341-06 N/A
Item |Description Qty |UOM Unit Price Ext. Total Unit Price Ext. Total Unit Price | Ext. Total
Germicidal Spray Cleaner
4 Colorless, lemon-scented with a pH range of 11.5-12.0; 40 |CASE $38.65 $1,546.00 $55.69 $2,227.60 NO BID NO BID
RTU; prevents cross contamination.
Number and size per case 12/32 oz. 12/18 oz N/A
Manufacturer MIDLAB FULLER INDUSTRIES N/A
Product Number 042000-12 F803215 N/A
GRAND TOTAL ITEMS 1-4 $15,280.50 $25,187.80
Delivery is guaranteed no later than days after order date. 7 10 45-60
Required Forms
Notification Of Intent To Respond YES YES NO
Non-Collusion Affidavit YES YES NO
EEOC Statement YES YES NO
Affidavit of Contractor/E-Verify YES YES NO
Signature Page YES YES NO
Debarment Statement YES YES NO
Price Sheet YES YES NO
Statement of Compliance YES YES NO
PACA Coversheet YES NO NO

CONTACTS:

1. Central Paper Corp./140 West Oxmoor Road/Homewood, AL 35209/Erick Petterson/205-942-6333/epetterson@centralpaper-al.com

2. 3G Chemcial Solutions, LLC/3000 MountainView Way/ Bessemer, Al 35020/Aleia Shipman/205-800-7709/sales@3gchemicalsolutions.com

3. Grainger Inc./100 Grainger Parkway/Lake Forest, IL 60045/Bobbi Barthel/847-753-4550/Bobbi.Barthel @Grainger.com
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